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        LTP SOLVEX 

 

High Performance Remover. 

For interior & exterior use. 

Removes silicone and acrylic waxes, adhesive polymers 

and epoxy grout residues. 

 

For Stone, Travertine, Terracotta, Slate, Sandstone, 
Flagstones, Quarry Tiles, Glazed Ceramics and 
Porcelain. 
 
A powerful non-caustic stripper that softens most types of 
surface sealer, which can then be removed with ease. 
Suitable for removing most wax, oil, silicone, acrylic, 
polyurethane sealers and residual epoxy grout. After 
washing and rinsing, surfaces are ideal for re-sealing. 

 Directions for use 

 
For application and cleaning tools see LTP website. 
 
Pour contents into a glass or metal container (not plastic).  
Apply generously by dabbing on with a cloth or brush. Work 
in manageable areas of no more than 5 sq metre and do 
not brush out.  Leave for up to 30 minutes,  but do not allow 
the solution to dry out.  If drying should occur within 30 
minutes apply a little more solution.  Use a course, stiff 
brush or abrasive pad to remove softened coating from the 
surface.  Repeat the process if unwanted material remains.  
Wash down with a dilute solution of LTP Grimex, rinse with 
plenty of water and leave to dry (min 24hrs) before re-
sealing.   Use natural fibre brushes.  Brushes made from 
synthetic fibres may be damaged by this product.  If you are 
unsure of correct application methods, test on an 
inconspicuous area, prior to general application. If removing 

residues from epoxy grout; apply making sure to avoid 
prolonged contact with the joint as well. Viscous 
solution should not drip if used on vertical surfaces. Protect 
acrylic  surfaces such as baths and shower trays from 
contact. 
 

 Coverage 

 

Light Stripping 8-10m²/litre  

Deep Stripping 5m²/litre 
 

  Storage information 

Store in a cool, dry, frost-free environment. 

Shelf Life – Up to 5 years     

 

 

 

 Health,Safety & Environmental 

 

HEALTH & SAFETY 

CONTAINS: Benzyl Alcohol;Silicic Acid, Lithium 

Magnesium Sodium Salt; (L) C9-11 Pareth-9 

Causes serious eye irritation 

Harmful if swallowed or if inhaled 

Keep out of reach of children. Do not breathe 

vapour/spray.  Wash contaminated skin thoroughly after 

handling. Do not eat, drink or smoke when using this 

product.   Use only outdoors or  in well ventilated area. IF 

SWALLOWED: Immediately call a POISON 

CENTRE/doctor. IF INHALLED: Remove person to fresh 

air and keep comfortable for breathing IF IN EYES: Rinse 

cautiously with water for several minutes. Remove contact 

lenses, if present and easy to do. Continue rinsing.     

Dispose of contents/container to a waste collection point 

in accordance with local regulations. 
 

WARNING  

 

 

 
This information is offered without guarantee. 

The material should be used so as to take 

account of the local conditions and the 

surfaces to be treated.  In case of doubt, the 

product should be tried out in an 

inconspicuous area.     

 

 

 


